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Nuts, Bolts, Screws, Clamps - Stainless steel grade 316
Terminals and Connecters - Conformal coating to prevent moisture build-up

Cabinet - Galvanized steel with phosphate treatment and painted, to prevent rust

Upgraded Accessories Included:

1.  Stainless Steel Inlet hoses (2) 
2.   Floor Bracket (2)

Spider wheel (Containing Bearings): Conformal coating to prevent rust

1.
2.
3.
4.

Tub Enamel: 2 coats of enamel on tub to prevent rust5.

Congratulations on your new Marine Washer!
In addition to its contemporary design, this is a highly sophisticated 
engineered product that will give you many years of satisfaction.

Here are some of the best reasons for buying your Marine Combo













Safe Disposal
Before discarding the appliance, please remove the door to prevent risk of child entrapment.

Keep children away from the shipping carton and packing components.

Please dispose off this appliance and all packaging material in accordance with 
local regulations.



DIAGRAM OF WASHER

Factory supplied accessories
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Floor Brackets
with screws (x4)



HANDLING AND PLACEMENT



INSTALLATION   INSTRUCTIONS
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Left Leveling Leg

2 Screws

Right Leveling Leg

2 Screws

Secure the appliance to the floor using the floor brackets provided.
1. Level the appliance

Tighten the two back feet so they are all the way in.

2. Place the brackets around the front feet (Fig.6).
3. Secure both brackets to the floor using a drill and 2 screws each (Fig.7).

Fig. 6 Fig. 7

Do not drag the appliance 
Do not hold protruding parts when lifting.
Install the appliance on a firm level surface.
Ensure the appliance is placed in a dry, well ventilated area.
Do not install the appliance outdoors where it can be exposed to freezing conditions.

Note: Any residual moisture inside the drum is due to the final testing 
         which every appliance undergoes before leaving the factory. 

Tilt the appliance back. Then adjust the two front feet up or down so the 
appliance does not rock side to side, or front to back when upright.



Note: If the electrical power supply does not meet the specifications listed above,
          please call a licensed electrician.





10.5

1.5  Platform



Salt Wash - 5 minute initial rinse before wash cycle begins to remove salt from clothing.



Fig. 12

(Fig. 12).

For small items use a mesh bag.















ERROR CODES





Marine Dryer
Model: 868



1. Scan QR Code
Open Smart Phone
Open Camera
Click the Link

2. Register online at ApplianceDesk.com/Warranty
3. QR Code is also used to obtain Product Information, Manuals and Updates

1 Year (Parts and Labor), 2 Years (Motor) and 5 Years (Rust Only)
 and limited commercial use (90 days) in USA and Canada.





1.  Cabinet - Galvanized steel with phosphate treatment and painted, to prevent rust
2.  Nuts, Bolts, Screws, Clamps - Stainless steel grade 316
3.  Terminals and Connecters - Conformal coating to prevent moisture build-up
4.  Spider wheel (Containing Bearings): Conformal coating to prevent rust
5.  Tub Enamel: 2 coats of enamel on tub to prevent rust

Upgraded Accessories Included:
1.  Stacking Kit (1) 
2.  Floor Bracket (2)
3.  Aluminum Flexible Duct (5 Feet Length + 2 Clamps)

Congratulations on your new Marine Dryer!
In addition to its contemporary design, this is a highly sophisticated 
engineered product that will give you many years of satisfaction.

Here are some of the best reasons for buying your Marine Dryer

1.  Reversible Door   
     Achieve the optimum fit in any space configuration.     

2.  Lint Reminder    
     Benefit from a Lint Reminder feature which reminds you to remove lint buildup 
     and prevent maintenance issues with your machine.     

3.  Diagnostic Menu 
     Take advantage of a diagnostic menu to help you troubleshoot any issues.     

4.  Multiple Dry Cycles 
     Use normal, heavy, eco, delicate, shoes, allergen 131, sanitize 165, or refresh 
     12 dry cycles for your clothes.    

5.  Child Lock 
     Protect young children with the Child Lock feature.

6.  Powerful Machine 
     This dryer is powered by 1200 Watts and 110V to make it a dynamic, 
     energy-efficient machine.     

7.  Efficiently Built 
     This machine has dimensions of 33.5 x 23.6 x 22.2 inches and a net weight of 79 lbs.     

FEATURES
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Safety

Use the appliance indoors. It is not intended to be used outdoors.
Ensure that open flame sources, such as candles are not placed on top of the dryer.
Do not place items in the dryer that are soiled with flammable liquids, oils and other 
chemicals. These items should be washed thoroughly before placing them in the dryer.
Ensure fabric softeners or products to eliminate static are not used inside the dryer, 
unless recommended by manufacturers of these products.
Do not dry items containing rubber, plastic or similar materials.
Ensure the dryer and electrical cord are not placed near heat sources, such as 
radiators, heaters, air ducts or in direct sunlight.
Ensure vents and ventilation openings are not blocked.
Ensure the power cord is not bent or twisted, and not exposed in an area where is 
could be a tripping hazard.
Do not use the dryer if the cord is damaged.
To disconnect the dryer, press the power button to turn it off, then grasp the plug of 
the power cored firmly and pull straight out of the outlet.
Do not open the dryer and reach into the drum while it is rotating.
Ensure the dryer is not overloaded.
Do not tamper with controls.
Perform regular maintenance and cleaning of lint filter after each use. Ensure periodic 
cleaning of exhaust duct is done by a qualified technician.
Check that foreign objects are not in the drum.
This appliance is not intended for use by persons, including children, with reduced 
physical, sensory or mental capabilities, or lack of experience and knowledge, unless 
they have been given supervision or instruction concerning use of the appliance by a 
person responsible for their safety.
Do not allow children to play on or in the appliance. Close supervision of children is 
necessary when the appliance is used near children.

In order to reduce the risk of fire, electric shock, and/or injury, please follow safety 
precautions. Read all instructions carefully and save for future reference.

Safe Disposal
Before discarding the appliance, please remove the door to prevent risk of 
child entrapment.

Keep children away from the shipping carton and packing components.

Please dispose off this appliance and all packaging material in accordance with 
local regulations.



(Watts)

(Watts)
(Watts)
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Technical Data



with screws (6)(2 brackets)
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Dryer - External Components

Hose ties (x2)



Handling and Placement
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must not

must be metal.

CAN / CSA Z240MH
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Installation

The dryer must be properly grounded. Do not modify the plug.
Do not install the dryer in a tight-fitting cabinet. Ensure there is adequate ventilation 
space all around the dryer (please see detailed installation instructions).

Do not use flexible plastic venting materials which may collapse. Use only vent hoses
that are approved by the manufacturer.

In Canada and the United States, only those foil-type flexible ducts, if any, specifically 
identified for use with the appliance by the manufacturer shall be used and that comply 
with the outline for the Clothes Dryer Transition Duct, subject to 2158A, shall be used.

In Canada, the exhaust duct shall be 4” (10.2 cm) in diameter.
In the United States, the exhaust duct shall be 4” (10 cm) in diameter.

The total length of flexible metal duct shall not exceed 8 feet (2.4 m).

The duct shall not be assembled with screws or other fastening means that extend 
into the duct and catch lint.
The appliance shall no be exhausted into a chimney, wall, ceiling, attic, crawl space, 
or a concealed space of a building.

The dryer must be installed and serviced by a qualified technician.

Install the dryer according to manufacturer's instructions and local codes.



Secure the appliance to the floor using the floor brackets provided.
1. Level the appliance

Tighten the two back feet so they are all the way in.

2. Place the brackets around the front feet (Fig.6).
3. Secure both brackets to the floor using a drill and 3 screws each (Fig.7).

Do not drag the appliance 
Do not hold protruding parts when lifting.
Install the appliance on a firm level surface.
Ensure the appliance is placed in a dry, well ventilated area.
Do not install the appliance outdoors where it can be exposed to freezing conditions.

Note: Any residual moisture inside the drum is due to the final testing 
         which every appliance undergoes before leaving the factory. 

Tilt the appliance back. Then adjust the two front feet up or down so the 
appliance does not rock side to side, or front to back when upright.

Installation Instructions
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Fig. 6 Fig. 7

Right Leveling LegLeft Leveling Leg
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Built-In, Recessed, Closet and Alcove Installation
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Venting Connections

is acceptable.

, as they may collect lint.
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Note: If the electrical power supply does not meet the specifications listed above,
          please call a licensed electrician.

This Marine Dryer must be connected to an individual circuit identical to the one specified on
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Electrical
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Program Selection Chart
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Control Panel



13

Display Panel

Operating Instructions
Before using the Dryer, please check the inside of the drum to ensure that children or pets have 
not climbed into the appliance.
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Maintenance 

Cleaning

Lint Filter
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Door Reversal
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Troubleshooting

for your dry cycle.

Remaining time 
changed to a
lower or a
greater number

In most cases, when your Dryer fails to work, the problems arising can be easily solved without having to 
call for a technician. Before calling for assistance, always check these points.
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Error Codes

Drum does not rotate

Problem

Belt has fallen off or broken.
Replace belt.

If Error Codes display that are other than the ones listed in the table, please contact Customer Service.
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